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Drs. Shir and Fitzcharles reply

To the Editor:

We thank Dr. Sarkozi for his response to our editorial entitled “Should
rheumatologists retain ownership of fibromyalgia?”1. We had hoped that
our comments would stimulate thought and discussion on the issue of opti-
mal care for patients with fibromyalgia (FM).

The issue of debate concerns our differing opinions regarding the
choice of healthcare professional that is best suited to provide care for
patients with FM. Dr. Sarkozi believes rheumatologists should continue to
manage patients with FM, based on a personal opinion that all FM origi-
nates as a result of generalized osteoarthritis (OA) or soft tissue rheuma-
tism. This simplistic view of causality is put forward to rationalize the
choice of the ideal treating physician. We reemphasize that the essence of
our message is to examine strategies for the total care of these patients,
who in addition to pain, have mood disorder, sleep abnormality, fatigue,
and a multiplicity of other somatic symptoms. Therefore successful man-
agement of FM can only be achieved if all components of the syndrome are
addressed, many of which are outside the scope of usual rheumatology
practice. Even if Dr. Sarkozi’s hypothesis is correct, we know of no treat-
ment intervention that can be offered uniquely by a rheumatologist to man-
age OA of the spine or soft tissue rheumatism that will cure symptoms of
FM.

Dr. Sarkozi acknowledges the complexity of pain mechanisms associ-
ated with FM, correctly criticizes the ACR criteria which address only the
symptom of pain, and agrees that although this condition remains a chal-
lenge to fully understand, patients are suffering and need treatment. His
opinion regarding the causation of FM is, however, based entirely on per-
sonal anecdote without any sound scientific proof. The publication of a
book cannot be construed as scientific evidence. We therefore strongly
refute this statement of proposed etiology for a condition that has impor-
tant implications from both the patient and societal perspectives.

The choice of generalized OA as the root cause for FM is a safe one. It
can be predicted with reasonable certainty that at least one radiograph or
computed tomography (CT) scan will show a modicum of OA in almost
any woman in her late 40s onwards. Facet joint OA is common and
occurred in 66% of all women, increasing to 89% in those over 60 years of
age, in a recent ancillary study to the Framingham Heart Study which
screened persons for coronary and aortic calcification by CT scans2. Facet
joint OA did not, however, correlate with a complaint of pain. By adding
in soft tissue rheumatism as another possible causative mechanism, one can
certainly bring the 66%–89% of patients with OA up to 100% for an objec-
tive physical diagnosis. Further, we are unable to understand how a few
localized OA nodes at the tips of the fingers in the distal interphalangeal
joints is an explanation for pain experienced throughout the body. The
mere presence of a finding is not sufficient justification for symptom attri-
bution. This simplistic attribution of OA as the root cause of FM, by per-
sonal opinion, is a clear win-win situation. The physician will always be
correct in declaring a diagnosis and the patient will be suitably impressed
by the excellent diagnostic abilities of the physician. This magical diagno-
sis does not translate into effective treatment for the patient with FM. If OA
is indeed the underlying cause of FM, why then do the majority of persons
with OA not have symptoms of FM?

Dr. Sarkozi states that he does not believe that FM is a “true central
pain syndrome,” but concedes that central sensitization is an identified
mechanism for pain in these patients. Central pain syndrome and central
sensitization essentially describe similar processes. The statement that
spontaneous pain of central sensitization cannot occur in the absence of a
stimulus is incorrect. Spontaneous pain without stimulation is well docu-
mented in phantom-limb disorder, complex regional pain syndrome, post-
herpetic neuralgia, and burning-mouth syndrome3-6. Therefore, it is some-
what obsolete to continue to believe that pain can only occur in the setting
of an identifiable physical abnormality.

Outcome in FM is not dismal. Studies from across the globe report
improvement in symptoms over time. Although a study of outcome by

postal questionnaire in the United States suggested continued pain and dis-
ability, publications from Australia, Mexico, and Canada have reported a
more favorable outcome7-10. In a recent prospective study of patients with
FM in Montreal, almost 50% reported a clinically meaningful improve-
ment in overall status of FM over a 3-year observation period10. This
improvement in outcome is further supported by the findings that 65% of
subjects improved over a 2-year period in a community based study in
England11.

There are still many gaps in our knowledge and understanding of FM.
The crucial issue at this time is to identify the most ideal and adequate care
for these patients. Simply ascribing a cause to explain symptoms of this
complex condition does not address total care for these patients. Therefore,
even with the absence of a solid understanding of causality, treatment
strategies to address the major symptom components of FM are crucial. We
therefore stand by our argument that a physician willing, capable, and qual-
ified to deal with all the complexity of the symptoms of this condition will
best serve the interests of the patient with FM. It is time for rheumatolo-
gists to acknowledge their limitations in caring for this complex and chal-
lenging syndrome.
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